
White Island Road Beeleek Enniskillen, Belleek, BT93 3DF
Stuart: 00447549955708 | Stuart: 00447549955708

?TAKE A CLOSER LOOK? ?2017 Toyota Landcruiser D-4D LC4 ? ?7
seater automatic 3 litre 173 bhp ?Call today to Secure with a
deposit ??Loaded with Extras?? ?Air Conditioning ?Alloy Wheels ?
Anti-Theft System ?Automatic Wipers ?Bluetooth ?Brake Assist
System ?CD Player ?Central Locking ?Centre Armrest ?Climate
Control ?Cruise Control ?Daytime Running Lights ?Dual Zone
Climate Control ?Electric Seats, Electric Windows ?Fog Lamps ?
Folding rear seats ?Heated Front Seats, Heated Seats ?Hill-Start
Assist ?Multi-Function Steering Wheel ?Parking Sensors ?Privacy
Glass ?Rear Spoiler ?Sat Nav ?Six speed transmission ?Traction
Control Call or message anytime, WhatsApp... ? Full walkaround
video available & more photos of car available. WhatsApp me on
Call to arrange your test drive 0044 7736 487650
#qualityusedcars #bmw #audi #sline #msport #carfinance
#toyota #hispeccars #familyrunbusiness #customerservice
#usedcars #repeatbusiness #seat #skoda #ford #vw #nissan
#derrycars #usedcarsni #dclcarsales Just in just in just in 2012
Toyota Landcruiser D-4D LC4 7 seater automatic 3 litre 173 bhp
Call today to Secure with a deposit +44 7736 487650

Vehicle Features

2nd row 40/20/40 split, 3 zone climate control, 3rd row curtain
airbags, 14 speakers, 18" alloy wheels, ABS+Electronic Brake
force Distribution, Accessory socket front and rear, Active
headrests, Active Traction Control (TRC), Adjustable steering
column, Air Conditioning, Alloy Wheels, Anti-Theft System, Anti
trapping/one touch open close front windows, Anti trapping/one
touch open close rear windows, Auto dimming mirrors,
Automatic Wipers, Battery back-up alarm sounder, Bluetooth,
Bluetooth telephone connectivity, Body colour electric
folding/heated door mirrors, Brake assist function, Brake Assist
System, Brushed aluminium fascia with wood inserts, CD Player,

Toyota Land Cruiser D-4D LC4 | 2012
SOLD SOLD SOLD SOLD

Miles: 91000
Fuel Type: Diesel
Transmission: Automatic
Colour: White
Engine Size: 3000
Tax Band: K (£430 p/a)
Body Style: Sport utility vehicle
Reg: SF12OSX

£22,995 
 



Central Locking, Centre Armrest, Chrome effect bar on front
grille, Clean air filter, Climate Control, Colour keyed bumpers,
Courtesy light delay, Cruise control, Curtain airbags, Daytime
Running Lights, Diesel particulate filter, Digital clock, Door ajar
warning, Driver/Front Passenger airbags, Driver/front passenger
side airbags, Driver and passenger sunvisors, Drivers/passenger
heated seats, Drivers knee airbag, Drivers Smart entry + Smart
start, Dusk sensor, EBD, Electric 3rd row 50/50 split/fold, Electric
driver and passenger seats, Electric Seats, Electric Windows, Fog
Lamps, folding and sliding seats, Front/rear armrests, Front and
rear colour coded parking sensors, Front and rear fog lamps,
Front and rear head restraints, Full size spare wheel, Fully
trimmed boot, Glass integrated antenna, HAC-Hill-start Assist
Control, HDD Navigation system, Headlight washers, Heated
Front Seats, Heated seats, Hill-Start Assist, Hill descent control,
Illuminated driver/passenger vanity mirror, Illuminated glovebox
with lock, Interior light, iPod/USB/MP3 connection, JBL Premium
Sound System, Leather steering wheel and gear knob, Leather
upholstery, Lights on warning, Luggage utility boot rails, Mud
flaps, Multi-Function Steering Wheel, Outside temperature
display, Parking Sensors, PAS, Privacy glass, Rain sensor, Rear
child proof door locks, Rear spoiler, Rear wiper, Recline function
on 2nd row seats, Remote central double locking, Remote fuel
flap release, Roof rails, Satellite Navigation Nav, Side steps,
Steering wheel audio controls, Toyota Electronic Modulated
Suspension-KDSS, Traction Control, Transponder engine
immobiliser, Trip computer, Under floor storage in 3rd row,
Vehicle Stability Control (VSC)


